
Civil Infraction 28.462(1) 
Mary Ahnen 
 May 29 (2 days ago) 

 

 

 

 to madcm 

 
 

So what do other counties have for a civil infraction 28.462(1) – Discharge of fireworks on 

public property.  What are your fines/costs?  Thank you in advance. 

  

Mary S. Ahnen 

Court Administrator/Magistrate 

98th District Court-Gogebic County 

200 N. Moore St. 

Bessemer, MI  49911 

  

906-663-4611 x3 

  
This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the  individual named. If you are not the named 

addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have 

received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure 

or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The 

sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-

mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-copy version. 
 
Tanya 

Todd tanya.todd@grcourt.org via googlegroups.com  
 

May 29 (2 days ago) 

 

 

 

 to madcm 

 
 

$50.00 fine, $50.00 costs, $10.00 fee. Our fireworks violations are few and far between and are 
written as violations of our city ordinance. 
 
Thank you, 
Tanya Todd 
 
61st District Court Clerk of the Court 
616.632.5580 
180 Ottawa Ave NW, Suite 1400 
Grand Rapids, MI 49503 
Tanya.Todd@grcourt.org 
"Serve the public and serve each other with integrity." 
 
This message has been prepared on computer equipment and resources owned by the 61st District Court. It is 
subject to the terms and conditions of the Court’s Computer Acceptable Use Policy. 

 
From: madcm@googlegroups.com <madcm@googlegroups.com> on behalf of Mary Ahnen 
<mahnen@gogebiccountymi.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2018 2:27 PM 
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To: 'madcm@googlegroups.com' 
Subject: Civil Infraction 28.462(1) 
 
Liz Stankewitz via googlegroups.com  
 

May 30 (1 day ago) 

 

 

 

 
   
to madcm 

 
 

We haven’t established f/c yet for that.  Sorry I can’t help. 

  
From: madcm@googlegroups.com [mailto:madcm@googlegroups.com] On Behalf Of Mary Ahnen 

Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2018 2:28 PM 
To: 'madcm@googlegroups.com' 

Subject: Civil Infraction 28.462(1) 
  

So what do other counties have for a civil infraction 28.462(1) – Discharge of fireworks on 

public property.  What are your fines/costs?  Thank you in advance. 
 
Nadine 

Lockwood LockwoodN@roscommoncounty.net via googl
egroups.com  
 

11:47 AM (22 hours 
ago) 

 

 

 

 

to madcm 

 
 

$120: $60 state fine/$50 court costs/$10 justice system 

  

Nadine J. Lockwood, Magistrate 

82nd District Court 

500 Lake Street 

Roscommon MI 48653 

lockwoodn@roscommoncounty.net 

989-275-5312 telephone 

989-275-6033 facsimile 

   

From: madcm@googlegroups.com <madcm@googlegroups.com> On Behalf Of Mary Ahnen 

Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2018 2:28 PM 

To: 'madcm@googlegroups.com' <madcm@googlegroups.com> 

Subject: Civil Infraction 28.462(1) 

  

So what do other counties have for a civil infraction 28.462(1) – Discharge of fireworks on 

public property.  What are your fines/costs?  Thank you in advance. 
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